Action Item Lincoln Trail Libraries System
December 17, 2007

Action Item No.: 2008-12

Subject: Ceiling Lighting and Tiles
Recommended by: Staff

Adopted:

The headquarters building at Lincoln Trail Libraries System is 36 years old and the fluorescent ceiling
lighting system is the original equipment as are the ceiling tiles. Over the past ten years, there has been
a gradual deterioration of this lighting system. The plastic fluorescent light tube sockets are brittle and
break easily; the electrical ballasts are leaking which causes short circuits in the wiring; the insulation is
hard and cracks and often flakes off. All of this causes the fixtures to short out and trip the circuit
breakers and this is becoming much more frequent as the system continues to age. The light fixtures
and ballasts were manufactured when electrical power was cheap and they are very inefficient by
today’s standards. Finally, the steel grid system for the lighting and ceiling tile is a non-standard size
and all of the replacement tiles have to be cut to fit the system. The grid system is an integral part of
the cold air return for the HVAC system. It is welded to the roof deck and therefore cannot be readily
replaced.

Following the July 2007 Board meeting LTLS staff contacted and worked with Russ Dankert &
Associates, Architects/Planners of Champaign, to review the needs of the ceiling lighting and ceiling tile
for the LTLS headquarters building. A bid proposal was issued to vendors on December 3, 2007 and
bids were due at LTLS on December 11, 2007. LTLS received responses from 12 vendors ranging from
a high bid of $98,800 to a low bid of $59,430. (Bid Tabulation attached) Russ Dankert reviewed
(review attached) the bid proposals along with Bob Towner, LTLS Operations Manager. After the
review it is recommended that LTLS accept the bid from Earl Olson Construction, subject to their
obtaining insurance as included in the bid documents. It is further recommended that an additional
$5,000 contingency be authorized to make any needed repairs to the building and roof once the work
begins.






BID TABULATION

PROJECT: New Lighting/Ceiling Work @
Lincoln Trail Libraries System

RUSSELL A. DANKERT & ASSOCIATES

DATE:
TIME:

5:00 P.M. CST

December 11, 2007

Champaign, IL 61821
LOCATION: Champaign, IL CONTRACT New Lighting/Ceiling Work
BIDDERS BID SECURITY | ADDEND | BASE BID BASE BID | BASE BID | COMBINED BID | REMARKS
A G-1 G-2 E-1 C-1 (OR G-3)
CARTER CONSTRUCTION SERV. | NONE ) 1&2 5,580.00 42,300.00 54,700.'00 98,800.00
Urbana, IL ,
PRECISION PAINTING & NONE 1&2 12,000.00 12,000.00* OBVIOUS
DRYWALL ERROR IN COMBINED BID
Champaign, IL
WITTE ELECTRIC. NONE 1&2 41,000.00
Champaign, IL
TATMAN - HARTRICH NO BID
Champaign, IL
-
POTTER ELECTRIC SERVICE NONE 1&2 38,650.00
Urbana, IL
CRANE ELECTRIC NO BID
Rantoul, IL
DOUG MGORE CONSTR., INC. NONE 1&2 75,417.00
White Heath, IL : ~
HENTGES CONSTRUCTION NO BID
Champaign, IL
GRUBB ELECTRIC NO BID
Danville, IL
PAUL PAINTING & DECOR. NO BID
Tolono, IL




BASE BID

BIDDERS BID SECURITY | ADDEND |BASEBID | BASE BID COMBINED BID | REMARKS
‘ A G-1 G-2 E-1 C-1 (OR G-3)

WAYNE SCHWAIGER NO BID

Mahomet IL

MIDWEST COMM COAT NONE 1&2 6,500.00

Mahomet, IL ‘

WINGLE CONSTRUCTION. NONE 1&2 85,220.00

Champaign, IL -

TATMAN - HARTRICH NO BID .

Mahomet, IL

GLESCO ELECTRIC NO BID

Urbana, IL _

EARL D.OLSON BIDBOND 5% |1&2 59,430.00

Urbana, IL

BORCHERS DECORATING. NONE 1&2 73,790.00

Champaign, IL

MIKE CAMPBELL NO BID

Camargo, IL

COLEMAN ELECTRIC NO BID

Mansfield, IL

KRUT’S ELECTRIC. NONE 1&2 35,400.00

Champaign, IL

ELECTRIC BOB’S NONE 1&2 40,753.00

Urbana, IL

DAVIS ELECTRIC NONE 1&2 42,000.00

Uebana, IL




